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NATIONAL CHAMPIONS AGAIN: PENANG CONTINGENT IS 
THE TOP CONTINGENT IN 2019 WORKERS’ DAY EVENT 
 
• PBAPP team is the “Champion Contingent” of the 2019 National 

Workers’ Day Celebration at the Putrajaya International 
Convention Centre on 1.5.2019. 

 
PENANG, 4.5.2019, Saturday: For the second time in three years, a 
Penang contingent has emerged as the champion in national-level 
“Workers’ Day” celebrations. 
 
On 1.5.2019, a Perbadanan Bekalan Air Pulau Pinang Sdn Bhd (PBAPP) 
team, comprising 80 personnel, won the “Champion Contingent” award in 
the 2019 National Workers’ Day Celebration. 
 
The team received its championship trophy from Prime Minister Tun Dr. 
Mahathir Mohamad at the Putrajaya International Convention Centre 
(PICC). 
 
While most Malaysians enjoyed an “off-day” on 1.5.2019, the PBAPP team 
performed set pieces to music for 2.5 hours, in front of a crowd of 
thousands of people in the PICC. The PBAPP team was led by Encik Mohd 
Zulkifli bin Abdul Hamid, Head of Human Resource Division. 
 
They competed against 4,898 participants representing 92 other 
contingents from all over Malaysia, including larger teams from many 
renowned organisations.  
 
Tun Dr. Mahathir, Human Resource Minister M. Kulasegaran, Finance 
Minister Lim Guan Eng, and Water, Land and Natural Resources Minister 
Dr. Xavier Jayakumar were amongst the VIPs present at this national 
event.  
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Our team’s spirited performance won over a panel of judges from the 
Malaysian Employers’ Federation (MEF), MTUC, CUEPACS and the 
Ministry of Human Resources (MoHR).  
 
2019 marks the second year in which a PBAPP team has emerged as the 
champion contingent. In 2017, PBAPP also did Penang proud by coming 
up tops in the national-level “Workers Day” celebrations. 
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